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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

 

Burns & McDonnell Expands Presence in Texas with New Office in San 
Antonio 

SAN ANTONIO, Texas — Burns & McDonnell, a 100% employee-owned engineering, 
architecture, construction, environmental and consulting firm, is expanding its Texas 
footprint with the opening of a new office in San Antonio. The move supports the firm’s 
long-term commitment to serving clients across the region and meeting the growing 
demand for critical infrastructure solutions in Central and South Texas. 

Located at 45 NE Loop 410, Suite 420, the San Antonio office strengthens the firm’s local 
presence and enhances its ability to deliver integrated services to industries that are key to 
the region’s economy, including electric and gas utilities, aviation, manufacturing and 
water. 

“We’re incredibly excited to establish a permanent presence in San Antonio,” says Jake 
Merriman, vice president and branch office manager for San Antonio operations. “This 
community is growing fast and facing increasingly complex infrastructure needs. Our local 
team is ready to help solve these challenges by bringing deep technical knowledge and 
experience, and a commitment to partnership that defines our approach.” 

Burns & McDonnell has long supported projects in the San Antonio area and throughout 
South Texas. Establishing a permanent office allows the firm to grow its local team, forge 
stronger partnerships with area stakeholders and contribute more directly to the region’s 
development. 

“Being part of San Antonio means more than just doing business here — it means being 
invested in the future of the region,” Merriman says. “We’re looking forward to hiring and 
growing talent locally, and collaborating closely with our clients to make an impact.” 

With more than 75 offices across the U.S. and around the world, Burns & McDonnell 
continues to invest in strategic locations that bring the firm closer to its clients and 
communities. The San Antonio office adds to the company’s strong presence in Texas, 
which includes major operations in Austin, Dallas-Fort Worth and Houston. 
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https://www.burnsmcd.com/
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About Burns & McDonnell   

Working from more than 75 offices around the world, Burns & McDonnell designs and 
builds critical infrastructure. Our family of companies — driven by engineers, construction 
professionals, architects, planners, technologists and scientists — delivers projects 
grounded in safety and a desire to make a difference as we make our clients successful. 
Founded in 1898, Burns & McDonnell is 100% employee-owned. Learn more.   
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