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KANSAS CITY, Missouri (May 8, 2023) — Burns & McDonnell is proud to announce 
that for the second year in a row it has been selected as a 2023 US Best Managed 
Company. Sponsored by Deloitte Private and The Wall Street Journal, the program 
recognizes outstanding U.S. private companies and the achievements of their 
management teams.  
 
Burns & McDonnell is among the 2023 designees of U.S. private companies that have 
demonstrated excellence in strategic planning and execution, a commitment to their 
people and to fostering a dynamic culture, as well as strong financials. Designees 
propelled their businesses forward and remained true to their purpose and values by 
investing in their people, creating advantage through digital transformation, taking 
measurable action on sustainability, and demonstrating their commitment to 
diversity, equity and inclusion. 

“We’ve worked relentlessly to make our clients and our communities successful since 
1898,” says Ray Kowalik, chairman and CEO of Burns & McDonnell. “Being 100% 
employee-owned is at the heart of Burns & McDonnell, and it is the key to having 
everyone care more about our clients, our communities, each other and our 
company. It also allows us to recruit and retain the best talent in our industry. It’s not 
just a benefit, it defines who we are to the core.” 

Applicants are evaluated and selected by a panel of external judges focused on 
assessing hallmarks of excellence in four key areas: strategy, ability to execute, 
corporate culture and governance/financial performance. They join a global 
ecosystem of honorees from more than 46 countries recognized by the Best 
Managed Companies program. 

About Burns & McDonnell About Burns & McDonnell About Burns & McDonnell About Burns & McDonnell  

Burns & McDonnell is a family of companies bringing together an unmatched team of 
more than 13,500 engineers, construction and craft professionals, architects, 
planners, technologists, and scientists to design and build our critical infrastructure. 
With an integrated construction and design mindset, we offer full-service capabilities. 
Founded in 1898 and working from 70 offices globally, Burns & McDonnell is 100% 
employee-owned. Learn how we are designed to build. 
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The Best Managed Companies program is a mark of excellence for private 
companies. U.S. designees have revenues of at least $250 million. Hundreds of 
private companies around the world have competed for this designation in their 
respective countries through a rigorous and independent process that evaluates four 
key criteria in their management skills and practices — strategy, execution, culture 
and governance/financials. U.S. program sponsors are Deloitte Private and The Wall 
Street Journal. For more information, visit www.usbestmanagedcompanies.com.  
    
Please see www.deloitte.com/us/about for a detailed description of our legal 
structure.  
 


